
Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com>

£40 Off today only!
8 messages

Secret Veneers <smile@secretveneers.com> Fri, Mar 30, 2018 at 12:41 AM
Reply-To: smile@secretveneers.com
To: Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com>

Can't See This Message? View in a browser

Good Friday is the NEW Black Friday!

ONLY 1 CODE PER PERSON USE PROMO CODE: "easter" Disount code 
ends 9pm Good Friday.



ENDING 19TH MARCH, 2018



You've received this email because you are a subscriber of this site

If you feel you received it by mistake or wish to unsubscribe, click here

Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> Fri, Mar 30, 2018 at 1:12 AM
To: smile@secretveneers.com

COULD YOU PLEASE TELL ME IF YOU HAVE BEEN ABLE TO GET THE PACKAGE CONTAINING MY IMPRESSIONS FOR ORDER #14651 RELEASED FROM 
ROYAL MAIL's SHEFFIELD HALFWAY PDO WHERE IT IS BEING HELD PENDING PAYMENT OF CUSTOMS VAT FEE SINCE 2/19/2018! I SPOKE WITH ELLA 
ABOUT THIS A WEEK AGO AND HAVE SENT 5 EMAILS TO 3 OF YOUR DIFFERENT EMAIL ADDRESSES AND NO ONE WILL REPLY TO ME!! I NEED TO 
KNOW WHAT TO TELL MY HUSBAND ABOUT THE $650 WE SPENT FOR THESE "MIRACLE" VENEERS THAT HAVE NOT SHOWN UP YET OR BEEN 
PROVEN IN ANY WAY TO BE A REAL THING THAT YOUR COMPANY CAN PRODUCE AND PROVIDE!!!

PLEASE PLEASE HELP ME! 
I TRIED TO PAY THE CUSTOMS FEES MYSELF VIA THE ROYAL MAIL'S WEBSITE BUT ONLY CARDS ISSUED IN THE UK ARE ACCEPTABLE!!!! 

On Mar 30, 2018, at 12:41 AM, Secret Veneers <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Can't See This Message? View in a browser

Good Friday is the NEW Black Friday!

ONLY 1 CODE PER PERSON USE PROMO CODE: "easter" Disount code 
ends 9pm Good Friday.



ENDING 19TH MARCH, 2018



You've received this email because you are a subscriber of this site

If you feel you received it by mistake or wish to unsubscribe, click here

Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> Thu, Jun 21, 2018 at 2:35 AM
To: Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com>

Hi there

Thanks for your email , the team have asked me to get in touch about your veneers. The team feel that they can only do the veneer to the teeth I have circled and 
they could be loose and you may need to use something like polygrip to hold it in. Please let me know if this is something you’re happy with And we will try and help 
you as best we can. Attached is the photos of your impressions.

Kind regards 
Ella



On Fri, 30 Mar 2018 at 09:12, Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> wrote:
COULD YOU PLEASE TELL ME IF YOU HAVE BEEN ABLE TO GET THE PACKAGE CONTAINING MY IMPRESSIONS FOR ORDER #14651 RELEASED 
FROM ROYAL MAIL's SHEFFIELD HALFWAY PDO WHERE IT IS BEING HELD PENDING PAYMENT OF CUSTOMS VAT FEE SINCE 2/19/2018! I SPOKE 
WITH ELLA ABOUT THIS A WEEK AGO AND HAVE SENT 5 EMAILS TO 3 OF YOUR DIFFERENT EMAIL ADDRESSES AND NO ONE WILL REPLY TO ME!! I 
NEED TO KNOW WHAT TO TELL MY HUSBAND ABOUT THE $650 WE SPENT FOR THESE "MIRACLE" VENEERS THAT HAVE NOT SHOWN UP YET OR 
BEEN PROVEN IN ANY WAY TO BE A REAL THING THAT YOUR COMPANY CAN PRODUCE AND PROVIDE!!!

PLEASE PLEASE HELP ME! 
I TRIED TO PAY THE CUSTOMS FEES MYSELF VIA THE ROYAL MAIL'S WEBSITE BUT ONLY CARDS ISSUED IN THE UK ARE ACCEPTABLE!!!! 

On Mar 30, 2018, at 12:41 AM, Secret Veneers <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Can't See This Message? View in a browser



Good Friday is the NEW Black Friday!

ONLY 1 CODE PER PERSON USE PROMO CODE: "easter" Disount code 
ends 9pm Good Friday.

ENDING 19TH MARCH, 2018



You've received this email because you are a subscriber of this site

If you feel you received it by mistake or wish to unsubscribe, click here

-- 
Hi there,

Kind Regards
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers

Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> Thu, Jun 21, 2018 at 1:57 PM
To: Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com>

Thank you for the information. I am willing to go forward with the process and try to do whatever I am able to on my end to help secure the veneers in place. I will be 
starting the process to a full upper denture the week after Labor Day so the upper veneers really only need to get me by until then. 

On Jun 21, 2018, at 2:35 AM, Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Hi there

Thanks for your email , the team have asked me to get in touch about your veneers. The team feel that they can only do the veneer to the teeth I have 
circled and they could be loose and you may need to use something like polygrip to hold it in. Please let me know if this is something you’re happy with 
And we will try and help you as best we can. Attached is the photos of your impressions.

Kind regards 
Ella
<IMG_1995.jpg>

On Fri, 30 Mar 2018 at 09:12, Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> wrote:
COULD YOU PLEASE TELL ME IF YOU HAVE BEEN ABLE TO GET THE PACKAGE CONTAINING MY IMPRESSIONS FOR ORDER #14651 
RELEASED FROM ROYAL MAIL's SHEFFIELD HALFWAY PDO WHERE IT IS BEING HELD PENDING PAYMENT OF CUSTOMS VAT FEE SINCE 
2/19/2018! I SPOKE WITH ELLA ABOUT THIS A WEEK AGO AND HAVE SENT 5 EMAILS TO 3 OF YOUR DIFFERENT EMAIL ADDRESSES AND 
NO ONE WILL REPLY TO ME!! I NEED TO KNOW WHAT TO TELL MY HUSBAND ABOUT THE $650 WE SPENT FOR THESE "MIRACLE" 
VENEERS THAT HAVE NOT SHOWN UP YET OR BEEN PROVEN IN ANY WAY TO BE A REAL THING THAT YOUR COMPANY CAN PRODUCE 
AND PROVIDE!!!

PLEASE PLEASE HELP ME! 
I TRIED TO PAY THE CUSTOMS FEES MYSELF VIA THE ROYAL MAIL'S WEBSITE BUT ONLY CARDS ISSUED IN THE UK ARE 
ACCEPTABLE!!!! 

On Mar 30, 2018, at 12:41 AM, Secret Veneers <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:



Can't See This Message? View in a browser

Good Friday is the NEW Black Friday!

ONLY 1 CODE PER PERSON USE PROMO CODE: "easter" Disount code 
ends 9pm Good Friday.



ENDING 19TH MARCH, 2018



You've received this email because you are a subscriber of this site

If you feel you received it by mistake or wish to unsubscribe, click here

-- 
Hi there,

Kind Regards
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers

Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> Fri, Jun 22, 2018 at 4:43 AM
To: Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com>

Hi there ,

Thanks for your email and I hope my reply finds you well. Great news!

Kind regards 
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers--

From: Autumn Dumbrique
Sent: 21 June 2018 21:57
To: Ella Carron Brown
Subject: Re: £40 Off today only!

Thank you for the information. I am willing to go forward with the process and try to do whatever I am able to on my end to help secure the veneers in place. I will be 
starting the process to a full upper denture the week after Labor Day so the upper veneers really only need to get me by until then. 

On Jun 21, 2018, at 2:35 AM, Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Hi there

Thanks for your email , the team have asked me to get in touch about your veneers. The team feel that they can only do the veneer to the teeth I have 
circled and they could be loose and you may need to use something like polygrip to hold it in. Please let me know if this is something you’re happy with 
And we will try and help you as best we can. Attached is the photos of your impressions.

Kind regards 

Ella

<IMG_1995.jpg>



On Fri, 30 Mar 2018 at 09:12, Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> wrote:

COULD YOU PLEASE TELL ME IF YOU HAVE BEEN ABLE TO GET THE PACKAGE CONTAINING MY IMPRESSIONS FOR ORDER #14651 
RELEASED FROM ROYAL MAIL's SHEFFIELD HALFWAY PDO WHERE IT IS BEING HELD PENDING PAYMENT OF CUSTOMS VAT FEE 
SINCE 2/19/2018! I SPOKE WITH ELLA ABOUT THIS A WEEK AGO AND HAVE SENT 5 EMAILS TO 3 OF YOUR DIFFERENT EMAIL 
ADDRESSES AND NO ONE WILL REPLY TO ME!! I NEED TO KNOW WHAT TO TELL MY HUSBAND ABOUT THE $650 WE SPENT FOR THESE 
"MIRACLE" VENEERS THAT HAVE NOT SHOWN UP YET OR BEEN PROVEN IN ANY WAY TO BE A REAL THING THAT YOUR COMPANY 
CAN PRODUCE AND PROVIDE!!!

PLEASE PLEASE HELP ME! 

I TRIED TO PAY THE CUSTOMS FEES MYSELF VIA THE ROYAL MAIL'S WEBSITE BUT ONLY CARDS ISSUED IN THE UK ARE 
ACCEPTABLE!!!! 

On Mar 30, 2018, at 12:41 AM, Secret Veneers <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Can't See This Message? View in a browser

Good Friday is the NEW Black Friday!

ONLY 1 CODE PER PERSON USE PROMO CODE: "easter" Disount code 
ends 9pm Good Friday.



ENDING 19TH MARCH, 2018



You've received this email because you are a subscriber of this site

If you feel you received it by mistake or wish to unsubscribe, click here

-- 

Hi there,

Kind Regards
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers

Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> Mon, Jul 9, 2018 at 10:19 PM
To: Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com>

Hi there. I am just checking in to see if my veneers were dispatched on the 28th of June as proposed per the e-mail I received from Lorraine Patrick on the 22nd of 
June? I have not been notified of any issues arising in the creation process nor have I received tracking information of any kind. 

On Fri, Jun 22, 2018 at 4:43 AM, Ella Carron Brown >smile@secretveneers.com<  wrote:

Hi there ,

Thanks for your email and I hope my reply finds you well. Great news!

Kind regards 
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers--

From: Autumn Dumbrique
Sent: 21 June 2018 21:57
To: Ella Carron Brown
Subject: Re: £40 Off today only!

Thank you for the information. I am willing to go forward with the process and try to do whatever I am able to on my end to help secure the veneers in place. I will 
be starting the process to a full upper denture the week after Labor Day so the upper veneers really only need to get me by until then. 

On Jun 21, 2018, at 2:35 AM, Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Hi there



Thanks for your email , the team have asked me to get in touch about your veneers. The team feel that they can only do the veneer to the teeth I have 
circled and they could be loose and you may need to use something like polygrip to hold it in. Please let me know if this is something you’re happy 
with And we will try and help you as best we can. Attached is the photos of your impressions.

Kind regards 

Ella

<IMG_1995.jpg>

On Fri, 30 Mar 2018 at 09:12, Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> wrote:

COULD YOU PLEASE TELL ME IF YOU HAVE BEEN ABLE TO GET THE PACKAGE CONTAINING MY IMPRESSIONS FOR ORDER #14651 
RELEASED FROM ROYAL MAIL's SHEFFIELD HALFWAY PDO WHERE IT IS BEING HELD PENDING PAYMENT OF CUSTOMS VAT FEE 
SINCE 2/19/2018! I SPOKE WITH ELLA ABOUT THIS A WEEK AGO AND HAVE SENT 5 EMAILS TO 3 OF YOUR DIFFERENT EMAIL 
ADDRESSES AND NO ONE WILL REPLY TO ME!! I NEED TO KNOW WHAT TO TELL MY HUSBAND ABOUT THE $650 WE SPENT FOR 
THESE "MIRACLE" VENEERS THAT HAVE NOT SHOWN UP YET OR BEEN PROVEN IN ANY WAY TO BE A REAL THING THAT YOUR 
COMPANY CAN PRODUCE AND PROVIDE!!!

PLEASE PLEASE HELP ME! 

I TRIED TO PAY THE CUSTOMS FEES MYSELF VIA THE ROYAL MAIL'S WEBSITE BUT ONLY CARDS ISSUED IN THE UK ARE 
ACCEPTABLE!!!! 

On Mar 30, 2018, at 12:41 AM, Secret Veneers <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Can't See This Message? View in a browser

Good Friday is the NEW Black Friday!

ONLY 1 CODE PER PERSON USE PROMO CODE: "easter" Disount code 
ends 9pm Good Friday.



ENDING 19TH MARCH, 2018



You've received this email because you are a subscriber of this site

If you feel you received it by mistake or wish to unsubscribe, click here

-- 

Hi there,

Kind Regards
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers

Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> Thu, Jul 12, 2018 at 4:27 AM
To: Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com>

Hi there ,

Thanks for your email and I hope my reply finds you well. I can see that a new impression kit was posted to you on the 27th June . The tracking information is..

RN395774085GB (royal mail)

Kind regards 
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers--

From: Autumn Dumbrique
Sent: 10 July 2018 06:19
To: Ella Carron Brown
Subject: Re: £40 Off today only!

Hi there. I am just checking in to see if my veneers were dispatched on the 28th of June as proposed per the e-mail I received from Lorraine Patrick on the 22nd of 
June? I have not been notified of any issues arising in the creation process nor have I received tracking information of any kind. 

On Fri, Jun 22, 2018 at 4:43 AM, Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:



Hi there ,

Thanks for your email and I hope my reply finds you well. Great news!

Kind regards 
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers--

From: Autumn Dumbrique
Sent: 21 June 2018 21:57
To: Ella Carron Brown
Subject: Re: £40 Off today only!

Thank you for the information. I am willing to go forward with the process and try to do whatever I am able to on my end to help secure the veneers in place. I will 
be starting the process to a full upper denture the week after Labor Day so the upper veneers really only need to get me by until then. 

On Jun 21, 2018, at 2:35 AM, Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Hi there

Thanks for your email , the team have asked me to get in touch about your veneers. The team feel that they can only do the veneer to the teeth I 
have circled and they could be loose and you may need to use something like polygrip to hold it in. Please let me know if this is something you’re 
happy with And we will try and help you as best we can. Attached is the photos of your impressions.

Kind regards 

Ella

<IMG_1995.jpg>

On Fri, 30 Mar 2018 at 09:12, Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> wrote:

COULD YOU PLEASE TELL ME IF YOU HAVE BEEN ABLE TO GET THE PACKAGE CONTAINING MY IMPRESSIONS FOR ORDER #14651 
RELEASED FROM ROYAL MAIL's SHEFFIELD HALFWAY PDO WHERE IT IS BEING HELD PENDING PAYMENT OF CUSTOMS VAT FEE 
SINCE 2/19/2018! I SPOKE WITH ELLA ABOUT THIS A WEEK AGO AND HAVE SENT 5 EMAILS TO 3 OF YOUR DIFFERENT EMAIL 
ADDRESSES AND NO ONE WILL REPLY TO ME!! I NEED TO KNOW WHAT TO TELL MY HUSBAND ABOUT THE $650 WE SPENT FOR 
THESE "MIRACLE" VENEERS THAT HAVE NOT SHOWN UP YET OR BEEN PROVEN IN ANY WAY TO BE A REAL THING THAT YOUR 
COMPANY CAN PRODUCE AND PROVIDE!!!

PLEASE PLEASE HELP ME! 

I TRIED TO PAY THE CUSTOMS FEES MYSELF VIA THE ROYAL MAIL'S WEBSITE BUT ONLY CARDS ISSUED IN THE UK ARE 
ACCEPTABLE!!!! 

On Mar 30, 2018, at 12:41 AM, Secret Veneers <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Can't See This Message? View in a browser



Good Friday is the NEW Black Friday!

ONLY 1 CODE PER PERSON USE PROMO CODE: "easter" Disount code 
ends 9pm Good Friday.



ENDING 19TH MARCH, 2018



cid:image002.png@01D40A26.A05F6B70

You've received this email because you are a subscriber of this site

If you feel you received it by mistake or wish to unsubscribe, click here

-- 

Hi there,

Kind Regards
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers

A01B285A21C64C0F8D34EC3F820F2F86.png
1K 

Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> Fri, Jul 13, 2018 at 3:59 AM
To: Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com>

I ABSOLUTELY DO NOT WANT TO MAKE IMPRESSIONS FOR THE 3RD TIME!!! IT HAS BEEN NEARLY 7 MONTHS SINCE I PURCHASED THE VENEERS 
WITHOUT THE ORDERBEING FULLFILLED!!
PLEASE ISSUE A REFUND AND CANCEL THE ORDER OR I WILL CANCEL IT MYSELF THROUGH MY CREDIT CARD COMPANY.

On Thu, Jul 12, 2018 at 4:27 AM, Ella Carron Brown >smile@secretveneers.com<  wrote:

Hi there ,

Thanks for your email and I hope my reply finds you well. I can see that a new impression kit was posted to you on the 27th June . The tracking information is..

RN395774085GB (royal mail)

Kind regards 
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers--



From: Autumn Dumbrique
Sent: 10 July 2018 06:19

To: Ella Carron Brown
Subject: Re: £40 Off today only!

Hi there. I am just checking in to see if my veneers were dispatched on the 28th of June as proposed per the e-mail I received from Lorraine Patrick on the 22nd of 
June? I have not been notified of any issues arising in the creation process nor have I received tracking information of any kind. 

On Fri, Jun 22, 2018 at 4:43 AM, Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Hi there ,

Thanks for your email and I hope my reply finds you well. Great news!

Kind regards 
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers--

From: Autumn Dumbrique
Sent: 21 June 2018 21:57
To: Ella Carron Brown
Subject: Re: £40 Off today only!

Thank you for the information. I am willing to go forward with the process and try to do whatever I am able to on my end to help secure the veneers in place. I will 
be starting the process to a full upper denture the week after Labor Day so the upper veneers really only need to get me by until then. 

On Jun 21, 2018, at 2:35 AM, Ella Carron Brown <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:

Hi there

Thanks for your email , the team have asked me to get in touch about your veneers. The team feel that they can only do the veneer to the teeth I 
have circled and they could be loose and you may need to use something like polygrip to hold it in. Please let me know if this is something you’re 
happy with And we will try and help you as best we can. Attached is the photos of your impressions.

Kind regards 

Ella

<IMG_1995.jpg>

On Fri, 30 Mar 2018 at 09:12, Autumn Dumbrique <autumndumbrique@gmail.com> wrote:

COULD YOU PLEASE TELL ME IF YOU HAVE BEEN ABLE TO GET THE PACKAGE CONTAINING MY IMPRESSIONS FOR ORDER #14651 
RELEASED FROM ROYAL MAIL's SHEFFIELD HALFWAY PDO WHERE IT IS BEING HELD PENDING PAYMENT OF CUSTOMS VAT FEE 
SINCE 2/19/2018! I SPOKE WITH ELLA ABOUT THIS A WEEK AGO AND HAVE SENT 5 EMAILS TO 3 OF YOUR DIFFERENT EMAIL 
ADDRESSES AND NO ONE WILL REPLY TO ME!! I NEED TO KNOW WHAT TO TELL MY HUSBAND ABOUT THE $650 WE SPENT FOR 
THESE "MIRACLE" VENEERS THAT HAVE NOT SHOWN UP YET OR BEEN PROVEN IN ANY WAY TO BE A REAL THING THAT YOUR 
COMPANY CAN PRODUCE AND PROVIDE!!!

PLEASE PLEASE HELP ME! 

I TRIED TO PAY THE CUSTOMS FEES MYSELF VIA THE ROYAL MAIL'S WEBSITE BUT ONLY CARDS ISSUED IN THE UK ARE 
ACCEPTABLE!!!! 

On Mar 30, 2018, at 12:41 AM, Secret Veneers <smile@secretveneers.com> wrote:



Can't See This Message? View in a browser

Good Friday is the NEW Black Friday!

ONLY 1 CODE PER PERSON USE PROMO CODE: "easter" Disount code 
ends 9pm Good Friday.



ENDING 19TH MARCH, 2018



cid:image002.png@01D40A26.A05F6B70

You've received this email because you are a subscriber of this site

If you feel you received it by mistake or wish to unsubscribe, click here

-- 

Hi there,

Kind Regards
Ella Carron Brown
Team Manager
www.secretveneers.com

Social Media Links- 

www.facebook.com/secretveneersuk
www.instagram.com/secretveneers
www.twitter.com/secretveneers


