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update roberts
From: Kim White <kwhite@southwestfunding.com>
Sent: Tue, Jan 19, 2021 at 4:37 pm
To: Rita
Cc: Sanchetz Sanchetz, Nathan Swann
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Dena just responded to me – underwriter not yet to file – she’s trying to get out today – said COULD be tomorrow  - - I asked her if
ANYONE else can just jump in and issue clear (management for example) - -
 – from memory it was only 2condi�ons should be simple –
I’ll be working late so will keep you updated as I know more – they are there �l 6 pm – so HOPEFULLY I will have by then  -  -
I’m pulling out all favors on this I know we need it NOW – well (last week - - heck last month to be honest)
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1730 General George Patton Dr Ste 102  Brentwood, TN 37027
(615) 712-6443 | (260) 221-0030

(800) 276-9087 | 162586
kwhite@southwes�unding.com  | h�ps://www.facebook.com/kim.darrwhite?ref=bookmar

IMPORTANT WIRE FRAUD NOTICE TO OUR VALUED CUSTOMERS: During transac�ons with Southwest Funding we will never ask you via email to wire or send funds to anyone,
including a �tle company. DO NOT comply with email instruc�ons to wire funds. Contact your Southwest Funding Licensed Loan Officer by telephone instead.
This Email is covered by the Electronic Communica�ons Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. Sec�ons 2510-2521 and is legally privileged. The informa�on contained in this Email is intended only for use
of the individual or en�ty named above. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, you are
hereby no�fied that any dissemina�on, distribu�on or copying of this communica�on is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communica�on in error, please immediately no�fy us
and destroy the original message. Thank You.
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