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Manoj Kumar <mojuroy@gmail.com> 25 November 2023 at 17:14

To: WhiteHat Jr <support@whitehatjr.com>, support@financepeer.com

In this mail you can check all the proof about my loan amount .
| have paid my entire loan amount. But you have not paid the cancellation amount to the financepeer.

Get in touch with the financepeer and clear my loan amount.

Solve this issue as soon as possible,

Thanks & regards
Manoj Tana
+918239839639

On Mon, Aug 8, 2022, 09:56 Manoj Kumar <mojuroy@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello sir / mem

My issues is not resolved by you

Financepeer is not updated my loan amount i want to cancel my nach

My loan amount is fully paid

So please solve my issue
I mention my number and details
8239839639

My loan I'd is 93122

My loan details please check

Support WhiteHat <support@whitehatjr.com> 25 November 2023 at 17:29
To: "mojuroy@gmail.com" <mojuroy@gmail.com>
Cc: "support@financepeer.com" <support@financepeer.com>
You have received a new comment on your Case # 04480099
Dear Parent,

Greetings from WhiteHat Jr.! Hope you are doing well.

We are working on your request and will be back as soon as possible. Please allow us some time, your patience is highly
appreciated.

If you have any student program related queries feel free to contact us at support@whitehatjr.com.
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You can manage and track the student's progress instantly. Kindly use our help center section of the Dashboard to avail
our services. Please feel free to contact us for any questions.

Happy Creating
WhiteHat Jr Support

[Quoted text hidden]

Manoj Kumar <mojuroy@gmail.com> 1 December 2023 at 09:54
To: Support WhiteHat <support@whitehatjr.com>
Cc: support@financepeer.com

| am still waiting for your response.

Thanks & regards
Manoj Tana
+918239839639
[Quoted text hidden]

Support WhiteHat <support@whitehatjr.com> 1 December 2023 at 11:08
To: "mojuroy@gmail.com" <mojuroy@gmail.com>
Cc: "support@financepeer.com” <support@financepeer.com>

[Quoted text hidden]

Manoj Kumar <mojuroy@gmail.com> 6 December 2023 at 12:17
To: Support WhiteHat <support@whitehatjr.com>
Cc: support@financepeer.com

| am still waiting for your response.
Give me proper resolution and pay the loan amount to the financepeer.

Thanks & regards
Manoj Tana
+918239839639
[Quoted text hidden]

Support WhiteHat <support@whitehatjr.com> 6 December 2023 at 13:17
To: "mojuroy@gmail.com" <mojuroy@gmail.com>
Cc: "support@financepeer.com" <support@financepeer.com>

You have received a new comment on your Case # 04480099
Dear Parent,
Greetings from WhiteHat Jr.! Hope you are doing well.
We are already working on your request with ticket number 04476890 for your future reference and will be back as soon
as possible. Please allow us some time, your patience is highly appreciated.

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

Manoj Kumar <mojuroy@gmail.com> 13 December 2023 at 11:37
To: Support WhiteHat <support@whitehatjr.com>
Cc: support@financepeer.com
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| am still waiting for your response.

Thanks & regards
Manoj Tana
+918239839639

[Quoted text hidden]

Manoj Kumar <mojuroy@gmail.com> 15 December 2023 at 15:09
To: Support WhiteHat <support@whitehatjr.com>

Dear Whitehatjr,

I am writing to inform you that | have cleared my laptop loan. However, it seems that there may be some confusion as
Whitehatjr has not yet confirmed the clearance of my loan. | kindly request that you review your records and update me
on the status of my loan clearance as soon as possible.

Thank you for your prompt attention to this matter.
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

Manoj Kumar <mojuroy@gmail.com> 18 December 2023 at 09:20
To: Support WhiteHat <support@whitehatjr.com>

| am waiting for your response.
Thanks & regards
Manoj Tana

+918239839639
[Quoted text hidden]
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